MARSHALL COUNTY COMMISSION

424 BLOUNT AVENUE

GUNTERSVILLE AL 35976

BID TABULATION FOR BID #18 - 25

JAIL INMATE SUPPLIES

BID OPENING DATE: September 2, 2025 2:00 PM

ITEM # 1 2 3 4 5 6 7 8 9 10 11 12 13
DESCRIPTION OF Inmate Pants, Inmate Pants, Inmate Pants,
ITEM Bath Towel Razor Blades Bar Soap Toothbrush Toothpoaste Mattress Flat Sheet Blanket Deodorant Maxi Pads Orange, Large Orange, XL Orange, 2XL
D7z 100/Case 144/ Case 144/ Case 144/ Case Each DZ 24/ Case 144/ Case 864 / Case Each Each Each
American Detention
Services No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Decatur, AL
337.44
$5.67 per C/576 or
Bob Barker Company, 100 or $0.065 per
Inc. 310.25 $34.02 C/600 347.50 34.55 334.50 $53.25 322.95 $107.50 355.50 Pad 37.75 37.75 38.00
Farqua Varnia, NC
Charm-Tex $10.90 37.89 341.90 36.89 328.89 $56.72 324.89 379.89 348.90 354.89 36.89 36.89 36.89
Brooklyn, NY
Hard Time Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Rome, GA
Tec Chem Co. LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hollywood, AL
Victory Supply LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Mount Pleasant, TN




ITEM # 14 15 16 17 18 19 20 21 22 23 24 25 26
Inmate
DESCRIPTION OF Inmate Pants, Inmate Pants, Inmate Shirts, Shirts, Inmate Shirts, | Inmate Shirts, | Inmate Shirts, Inmate Pants, Inmate Pants, Inmate Pants, Inmate Pants, Inmate Pants, Inmate Shirts,
ITEM Orange, 4XL Orange, 6XL Orange, Large Orange, XL Orange, 2XL Orange, 4XL Orange, 6XL Pink, Large Pink, XL Pink, 2XL Pink, 4XL Pink,6XL Pink, Large
Each Each Each Each Each Each Each Each Each Each Each Each Each
American Detention No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Decatur, AL
Bob Barker Company,
Inc. $8.95 $9.75 37.00 37.00 37.00 $7.40 38.25 37.75 37.75 38.00 $8.95 39.75 37.00
Farqua Varnia, NC
Charm-Tex $6.89 $7.54 $6.18 $6.18 $6.18 $6.68 $7.18 $6.89 $6.89 $6.89 $6.89 $7.54 $6.18
Brooklyn, NY
Hard Time Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Rome, GA
Tec Chem Co. LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hollywood, AL
Victory Supply LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Mount Pleasant, TN




ITEM # 27 28 29 30 31 32 33 34 35 36 37 38 39
Inmate PVC Shower PVC Shower PVC Shower PVC Shower PVC Shower PVC Shower
DESCRIPTION OF Inmate Shirts, Inmate Shirts, Inmate Shirts, Shirts, Pink, | Shoe, Orange, | Shoe, Orange, | Shoe, Orange, Shoe, Orange, Shoe, Orange, Shoe, Orange, EVA Sandals, EVA Sandals, EVA Sandals,
ITEM Pink, XL Pink, 2XL Pink, 4XL 6XL Size 8 Size 9 Size 10 Size 11 Size 12 Size 13 Black, Small Black, Medium Black, Large
Each Each Each Each Pair Pair Pair Pair Pair Pair Pair Pair Pair
American Detention
Services No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Decatur, AL
Bob Barker Company,
Inc. $7.00 $7.00 $7.40 $8.25 $2.60 32.60 $2.60 $2.60 $2.60 $2.60 $3.00 $3.00 $3.00
Farqua Varnia, NC
Charm-Tex $6.18 $6.18 $6.68 $7.18 $2.79 $2.79 $2.79 $2.79 $2.79 $2.79 $4.09 $4.09 $4.09
Brooklyn, NY
Hard Time Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Rome, GA
Tec Chem Co. LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hollywood, AL
Victory Supply LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Mount Pleasant, TN




ITEM # 40 41 42 43
Combined
Sheet,
DESCRIPTION OF EVA Sandals, EVA Sandals, EVA Sandals, |Overall Quilt,
ITEM Black, XL Black, 2XL Black, 3XL Navy
Pair Pair Pair Each
American Detention
Services No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Decatur, AL
Bob Barker Company,
Inc. $3.00 $3.00 $3.00 $32.00
Farqua Varnia, NC
Charm-Tex $4.09 $4.09 $4.09 No Bid
Brooklyn, NY
Hard Time Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Rome, GA
Tec Chem Co. LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hollywood, AL
Victory Supply LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Mount Pleasant, TN
Bob Barker $648.76
Charm-Tex $538.04

Awarded 9/10/2025
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